
Dist 30 Meeting Minutes (Area 75)
Sep 6, 2024 6:30pm at the Wesley Ave Alano Club
www.rockcoaa.net

Attendees: Joel B, Lori B, Jim C, Jim F, Laura H, Judy H, Jim McC, David McK,Peter R, Randy
W, Nicky

Meeting opened with the Serenity Prayer, 9th tradition and 9th concept read

Treasurer’s Report - Peter R

DCM Report - no report

GSR Reports



Early Risers - Jim reported for Gary that the meetings are very well attended averaging 12-30.
Saturday mornings are highly attended.

Keys to the Kingdom -.Jim reported they’re doing excellent with good turnout with 30-35
people most of the time.

Unity Group - no report

Steps to Success - Jim reported, kinda like Jim said they can have smaller meetings some
weeks then better attended meetings other weeks.

Milton Tue, Thur and Fri all 7pm - Laura reported Tues averages about 20 people and they
give out Big Books to first time attendees. Fri night isn’t as well attended but it’s still meeting
every week. Thurs are very well attended with 25-30 attending. Mid October for the next game
night, keep your eyes out for flyers.

No Name Group -.Randy reported Tues Big Book averages around 5 and it’s a good meeting.
Fri meeting has light attendance but the meeting is still open and meets weekly.

Men in Recovery - David reported it’s as good as ever with 25-30 attending. Newcomes are
showing up. Meeting just moved back inside as the weather has turned to fall and dusk occurs
earlier.

Edgerton Monday Discussion Group - no report

Edgerton Thursday Noon - no report

Blackhawk Good Fellowship -.Randy reported that the meeting is still looking for someone to
step up and help Steve R run the meeting. Speakers are lined up for Sept and they’re looking
for speakers for October.

The Gifts Group - no report

Beginner’s Group - no report

New Voices - no report

We are who we are - Judy reported the meeting is going very well with good attendance and
some new people coming in.

As Bill Sees It - no report

Mid Morning Group - no report



KISS - Laura reported for Diane that it’s a strongly attended (25+) meeting and big books are
provided to newcomers.

TNT - no report

WOW - no report

HOW -.Jim reported attendance varies from 4-12 and attendees are getting involved in service
helping with coffee and trash removal.

Committee Reports

Archives - Randy reported he received archives from the 1st or 2nd recovery roundup from the
12x12. If any groups want anything archived get ahold of Randy W. Randy has group forms
that can be filled out to archive the history of the various AA groups in the district.

Women’s Corrections - Lori B

The women’s meetings are going well. Sometimes 1 meeting and sometimes 2. Looking for
more volunteers so any women interested in helping out with the women’s corrections AA
meetings please contact Lori at 608-346-5656. They like to have 2 AA members going in to
lead the meetings. Meetings are still bi-weekly due to the on-going construction.

They meet bi-weekly on Wed at 6:30pm and the meetings last until 8 or 8:30pm. The NA
groups only come in twice a month so the inmates really appreciate having weekly AA
meetings. Both the men and women really appreciate all of the AA literature that the district and
others have donated. So thank you to everyone who’s participated directly and indirectly through
you meeting donations to the groups that do donate to the district. Inmates can have one on
one visitors from the AA community.



Men’s Corrections - No report. The men’s meeting meets on opposite weeks of the women on
Tuesdays (due the construction). The meetings are well attended and the inmates are well
behaved. Brandon has a new phone #. If any men are interested in getting involved with the
men’s corrections meetings contact him at 608-371-4476. Currently there are 3 men cleared
and helping run the meetings and they could really use more help in running these meetings as
90% of the inmates are male.

PI/CPC (Public Information and Cooperation with the Professional Community) - Open position.
No AA meetings listed in community events in the Janesville Gazette. We continue to contact
them.

MAICO - Heather mentioned to make sure to read those MAICO newsletters.

Treatment - Position open. Lori reported she’s been helping with the Crossroads meeting.
Looking for speakers for the 3rd Wed of the month in the evening 6pm and the meeting lasts a
little over a hour. Very laid back open discussion/conversation. Lori B reported she talked with
Zach and he wants to continue to speak at Crossroads for the daytime meeting.

Literature/Grapevine - Joel reported - Grapevine and La Vina communicates the experience,
strength, and hope of its contributors and reflects a broad geographic spectrum of current A.A.
experience. Throughout its history the magazine has been a forum for the varied and often
divergent opinions of A.A.s around the world. Download and try the Grapevine and LaVina apps
for free from the Apple App Store and the Google Play Store.
View the AA Gravepine Catalog here
https://www.aagrapevine.org/sites/default/files/2024-04/2024_Catalog_GV-LV.pdf
You can submit a story, caption for the monthly cartoon and vote on the future captions as well
at aagrapevine.org. This month’s featured section is “Young & Sober.” Members share about
the joys and challenges of getting sober and active in AA in their teens, 20s, and 30s.

Audio and visual media help to carry A.A.’s message of recovery. Public service
announcements (PSAs) are available for the public and professionals. We can provide PSAs in
a variety of formats as needed for TV and radio broadcasts. Find other media here to reach
young people, professionals working with alcoholics, and others.
https://www.aa.org/resources/media AA has three newsletters for you to explore that are
intended for various audiences. Box 4-5-9, About AA (for professionals) and Sharing from
Behind the Walls. You can order and view AA literature, pamphlets and guidelines directly from
AA at onlineliterature.aa.org. AAWS encourages ordering of literature and other items via your
local groups, Intergroups and Central Offices.

Old Business

2025 AA World Conference registration and housing processing opens Sept 10, 2024 at 11am
CST. Here’s a link to the registration brochure/information.

https://www.aagrapevine.org/sites/default/files/2024-04/2024_Catalog_GV-LV.pdf
https://www.aa.org/resources/media


https://www.aa.org/sites/default/files/literature/IC2025%20Registration%20Form%20Comm%20-
%20EN.pdf

2025 AA World Conference Frequently asked questions
https://www.aa.org/international-convention-2025-faqs

More information on attending the 2025 AA World Conference if you have a crimial record
and/or an alcohol or drug offense
https://www.canada.ca/en/immigration-refugees-citizenship/services/immigrate-canada/inadmiss
ibility/overcome-criminal-convictions.html

New Business

Motion passed to reimburse David M (alt-DCM) to attend the Area conference Nov 1-3 on behalf
of Dist 30.

Motion passed to renew the (2) annual Grapevine subscriptions for the Rock County
Correctional Facility.

Nicky mentioned that some newer AA members were looking for later evening AA meetings
starting at 8pm and 9pm or later.

Jim mentioned he received a call that the district website fliers haven’t been updated and there’s
an individual willing to help out with the website. Suggested that the interested party show up at
district for discussion.

Area 75 Assembly Sunday - Sept 15th at the Madison Senior Center 330 W Mifflin St, Madison,
WI 53703

Area 75 Conference & Assembly - Hosted by: District 31 Area 75 Conference November 1-3,
2024 Chula Vista Resort, Wisconsin Dells, WI 53965

Next district meeting is Fri Oct 4th at 6:30pm at the Wesley Ave Alano Club.

Check out https://rockcoaa.net/events.html for all the event fliers!

https://www.aa.org/sites/default/files/literature/IC2025%20Registration%20Form%20Comm%20-%20EN.pdf
https://www.aa.org/sites/default/files/literature/IC2025%20Registration%20Form%20Comm%20-%20EN.pdf
https://www.aa.org/international-convention-2025-faqs
https://www.canada.ca/en/immigration-refugees-citizenship/services/immigrate-canada/inadmissibility/overcome-criminal-convictions.html
https://www.canada.ca/en/immigration-refugees-citizenship/services/immigrate-canada/inadmissibility/overcome-criminal-convictions.html
https://rockcoaa.net/events.html











